
Description pricing per Season Total Northstar Equipt Progress Rail FCM RAIL RELAM RCE
Kershaw Tie Crane Model 1212 YR 1 54,960.00$                20,010.00$         17,472.00$     24,570.00$   42,000.00$         
Kershaw Tie Crane Model 1212 YR 2 54,960.00$                20,010.00$         17,472.00$     24,570.00$   42,000.00$         
Kershaw Tie Crane Model 1212 YR 3 54,960.00$                15,498.00$         11,400.00$     24,570.00$   33,000.00$         
Kershaw Tie Crane Model 1212 YR 4 54,960.00$                15,498.00$         11,400.00$     24,570.00$   27,000.00$         
Racine Dual Anchor Spreader YR 1 51,072.00$                24,492.00$         26,508.00$     19,680.00$   NO-BID
Racine Dual Anchor Spreader YR 2 51,072.00$                24,492.00$         26,508.00$     19,680.00$   NO-BID
Racine Dual Anchor Spreader YR 3 51,072.00$                17,532.00$         17,400.00$     19,680.00$   NO-BID
Racine Dual Anchor Spreader YR 4 51,072.00$                17,532.00$         17,400.00$     19,680.00$   NO-BID
Racine Dual Anchor Adjuster YR 1 40,686.00$                19,524.00$         19,308.00$     16,710.00$   NO-BID
Racine Dual Anchor Adjuster YR 2 40,686.00$                19,524.00$         19,308.00$     16,710.00$   NO-BID
Racine Dual Anchor Adjuster YR 3 40,686.00$                13,974.00$         11,400.00$     16,710.00$   NO-BID
Racine Dual Anchor Adjuster YR 4 40,686.00$                13,974.00$         11,400.00$     16,710.00$   NO-BID
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